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phase down unabated coal power and inefficient fossil fuel subsidies COP26 final deal. COP26 will go down in history as on a par with the 
Nuremberg Rallies in its support for mass extermination by suffocation by massive carbon dioxide leaks from carbon capture stores risked 
on the pretext of abating fossil fuels. To give an idea of the apocalyptic dangers of massive leaks of concentrated carbon dioxide gas, Ive 
run the numbers and published them to advise that we must stop ignorant and reckless politicians in government from funding Big Oils 
exceptionally dangerous carbon capture and storage scam. Stop them now before they kill a lot of people! Source: "Dry ice thrown in 
swimming pool kills three and puts seven in intensive care at popular Russian Instagrammers 29th birthday party" So 20 million tonnes of 
carbon dioxide is enough to kill 30% of the worlds population instantly but since there would be no-one left unaffected there would be no 
intensive care so everyone else could possibly die too. But 70 million tonnes of concentrated CO2 is enough to kill 100% of the worlds 
population instantly! Please note that leaks from CO2 storage-bombs present a far more deadly health and safety risk to populations than 
climate change itself. Humanity would be much safer doing nothing at all about climate change meantime than proceeding now with such 
extremely reckless carbon dioxide storage plans. These plans are now so far advanced that they present a clear and present danger to the 
public that I deeply regret as a supporter of democracy and in every other circumstance a sceptic and opponent of judicial or military 
dicatorship that in the particular circumstance of the extreme danger of foolish elected politicians going ahead with carbon dioxide storage 
it is now preferable to suffer a temporary suspension of the authority of elected government in order to impose judicial or martial law just 
to stop the very foolish civilian politicians in parliaments from going ahead with this. I am so sorry that we have come to this Rubicon but 
we are left with no better option. My best scientific advice is that the courts and / or the military should move now to arrest those who are 
intent on proceeding with this deadly, leaky carbon dioxide storage-bomb scam. See also "Limnic eruption" Wikipedia about the related 
carbon dioxide natural disaster. "Bhopal disaster" Wikipedia about the related worlds worst industrial disaster when over 500,000 people in 
the small towns around a pesticide plant in Bhopal, Madhya Pradesh, India were exposed to the highly toxic gas methyl isocyanate. "Aliso 
Canyon gas leak" Wikipedia about the related massive natural gas leak near Los Angeles, California. "Construction begins on worlds first 
large-scale liquid CO2 transport ships" These vessels will carry 7,500 cubic metres of liquid CO2 of mass 8260 tonnes which if leaked would 
form a poisonous CO2 gas cloud that could kill 1 million people. These vessels are apocalyptic weapons of mass destruction and should be 
outlawed! CEASE & DESIST! NPR: "The U.S. is expanding CO2 pipelines. One poisoned town wants you to know its story." There is a 
scientifically correct way to do carbon capture and it requires no long term mass storage of CO2 and no use of fossil fuels - this is a 
genuinely green and sustainable carbon capture. Ørsted's FlagshipONE project captures CO2 from a biomass-fired combined heat and 
power plant in Örnsköldsvik, Sweden, combining biogenic CO2 with renewable hydrogen in Ørsted's FlagshipONE plant, to produce the 
eFuel, eMethanol. I would add that methanol is somewhat too poisonous to use as a consumer fuel but a further dehydration reaction can 
produce safer dimethyl ether DME fuel from methanol. Nevertheless Ørsted's FlagshipONE project is a huge step in the right direction for 
carbon capture and deserving of praise, recognition and support. Well done! https://scottishscientist.wordpress.com/
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